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Alerts

1 event
64 results matching for 'Applications Lapsed, Refused Or Withdrawn, Patents Ceased or Expired'
during March 2004.

Number Title Date
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2000247382 Permanent decrease of wood hardness 24 Mar 2004

2000250210 Vapor phase neutralization in integrated solvent deasphalting and gasification 24 Mar 2004

2000253328 Poly-primed amplification of nucleic acid sequences 24 Mar 2004

2000275930 Improved system for printing and applying tape onto surfaces 24 Mar 2004

2001100279 Pageframe 24 Mar 2004

2001100330 Interactive CD guide 24 Mar 2004

2001100333 Dolphin disco 24 Mar 2004

2001100334 Fieldhockey stick with moving weights 24 Mar 2004

2001100336 Plastic drink/plate clip 24 Mar 2004

2001100337 Waldmanns new style connector 24 Mar 2004

2001100338 Sunglove 24 Mar 2004

2001100341 Pattern for forming a paper cup stack holder 24 Mar 2004

2001100342 A fingerstall 24 Mar 2004

2001100344 Faceplate of a blower for an air conditioner 24 Mar 2004

2001100345 Bi-functional roller skate 24 Mar 2004

2001100347 IFCS firewatch 24 Mar 2004

2001100348 Box with separate compartments 24 Mar 2004

2001100369 Voice-on-demand communication system 24 Mar 2004

2001218027 24 Mar 2004

2001251271 Polymeric films having anti-static properties 24 Mar 2004

2001251272 Polyurethane dispersions and films produced therewith 24 Mar 2004

2001252679 Plaster 24 Mar 2004

2001254990 Propofol for treatment of sepsis 24 Mar 2004

2001256769 Triazole derivatives 24 Mar 2004

2001257559 Dual dimensional shoe sensor for surgical control 24 Mar 2004

2001258127 Method of producing structures using centrifugal forces 24 Mar 2004

2001259384 Foldable iris fixated intraocular lenses 24 Mar 2004

2001259541 Injectable iris fixated intraocular lenses 24 Mar 2004

2001259782 Absorbent structure with integral vapor transmissive moisture barrier 24 Mar 2004

2001259971 Motion platform with six linear electromagnetic actuators 24 Mar 2004

2001259974 Combination therapy using cox-2 selective inhibitor and thromboxane inhibitor and
compositions therefor

24 Mar 2004

2001261466 Therapeutic approaches to diseases by suppression of the nurr subfamily of nuclear
transcription factors

24 Mar 2004

2001261515 Treatment of human papillomavirus (hpv)-infected cells 24 Mar 2004

2001261533 Compositions and methods for epitope mapping 24 Mar 2004

2001261667 Ultrasound speed measurement of temperature and pressure effects 24 Mar 2004

2001261682 Electronic trading systems and methods 24 Mar 2004

2001261689 Electrically conducting nanocomposite materials for biomedical applications 24 Mar 2004
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2001261690 Organosiloxane containing modified groups in agricultural compositions 24 Mar 2004

2001262265 Measuring device for detecting a body moving in relation to a tubular container 24 Mar 2004

2001263071 Identifying clusters of transcription factor binding sites 24 Mar 2004

2001263136 Polyurethanes containing dispersed crystalline polyesters 24 Mar 2004

2001263137 Polyurethanes containing reinforcing polymers 24 Mar 2004

2001263886 Hair cosmetic agent 24 Mar 2004

2001264780 Condiment dispensing nozzle apparatus and method 24 Mar 2004

2001274015 Cassette for tape type data recording medium, especially a reel cassette 24 Mar 2004

2001277489 Radar device for object self-protection 24 Mar 2004

2003100989 Air keys - method for non touch interaction with a computing device 24 Mar 2004

2003101017 Red mini rose and plants in the nutrient gel 24 Mar 2004

2003101041 Casual Workforce instant response portal 24 Mar 2004

2003101048 Automatic water supply change-over system 24 Mar 2004

2003101055 solar powered lawn mowing service 24 Mar 2004

2003231669 Process for preparing a modified zeolite 24 Mar 2004

2003235063 Physiological monitor and method of minimizing noise 24 Mar 2004

2003236445 Formulation having a Papilloma Virusspecific Protein, and the Production and Use
Thereof

24 Mar 2004

2003236458 Telecommunications billing method 24 Mar 2004

2003236482 Glass laminate for threat resistant window systems 24 Mar 2004

2003901040 Method for use in a plasma arc furnace 24 Mar 2004

2003901166 Support device for an elongated article 24 Mar 2004

2003903524 Mixing apparatus 24 Mar 2004

2003906971 Method and Apparatus for Storing Heat Energy 24 Mar 2004

2003907123 Beach soccer court in lawn bowling green. / club 24 Mar 2004

2003907141 Screen 24 Mar 2004

2004901092 Downpipe rain water collector 24 Mar 2004

2004901118 Disposable Locking Forceps or Tweezers 24 Mar 2004
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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